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MASTER SUITE, An Erotic Romance m/f

CAUTION: Explicit sexual behavior and graphic language (Purchase by anyone under the age of 18 is
prohibited)

Dr. Adam King is a brilliant physician and researcher. He’s also a cocky bastard who has been sent to the
Fini Luxury Resort and Spa for a sensitivity class. When given the opportunity to be a Dom to a first-time
Sub, he upgrades his reservation.

Dr. Whitney Grant is a well-respected pediatrician who needs to escape from the pressures of her job. For
once, she wants someone else to make all the decisions while she fulfills her wildest sexual fantasies as a
Submissive.

Together they explore the sensuous world of BDSM game play. When their weekend of erotic sex is
interrupted by an unexpected emergency, Whitney is forced to break the fantasy of the Master Suite and run
away.

They meet in the Master Suite for a weekend neither of them will ever forget.

MASTER SUITE is the second book in the Room Service Series, but it stands alone. It contains non-stop
sexual erotic action and romance with light BDSM as Adam shows Whitney, a first-time Sub, the ropes. It
has a happy-for-now or possibly forever ending.
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From reader reviews:

Andrea Toliver:

This book untitled MASTER SUITE (Room Service Book 2) to be one of several books which best seller in
this year, here is because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily to buy
this kind of book in the book retail store or you can order it by using online. The publisher of this book sells
the e-book too. It makes you quickly to read this book, because you can read this book in your Smart phone.
So there is no reason for you to past this publication from your list.

Candy Dixon:

The guide untitled MASTER SUITE (Room Service Book 2) is the reserve that recommended to you to
learn. You can see the quality of the book content that will be shown to a person. The language that writer
use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The article writer was did a lot of exploration when
write the book, and so the information that they share to you is absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-
book of MASTER SUITE (Room Service Book 2) from the publisher to make you more enjoy free time.

Fred Polak:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray anyone, why because this MASTER SUITE (Room Service Book 2)
publication written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book which might be
understand by anyone who all read the book. Written with good manner for you, leaking every ideas and
writing skill only for eliminate your hunger then you still uncertainty MASTER SUITE (Room Service Book
2) as good book not only by the cover but also from the content. This is one book that can break don't
evaluate book by its handle, so do you still needing one more sixth sense to pick this!? Oh come on your
studying sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to listening to one more sixth sense.

Chantal Dow:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you could have it in e-
book approach, more simple and reachable. That MASTER SUITE (Room Service Book 2) can give you a
lot of pals because by you taking a look at this one book you have matter that they don't and make an
individual more like an interesting person. This book can be one of one step for you to get success. This
reserve offer you information that possibly your friend doesn't realize, by knowing more than additional
make you to be great individuals. So , why hesitate? We need to have MASTER SUITE (Room Service
Book 2).
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