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The passing of the Corporate Manslaughter and Corporate Homicide Bill in the UK and increasing public
and investor pressure for good Corporate Governance and Corporate Social Responsibility, means
organizations now, more than ever, need to ensure they do all they can to prevent major accidents. However,
past experience shows that just implementing safety management systems is not enough and this book makes
the case for a more holistic and ethical approach to improving corporate systems as a whole.

Preventing Corporate Accidents shows how major accidents can result from human error and defects in
corporate systems. The book describes accident prevention strategies, from safety culture, safety
management systems, foresight and planning to safety regulations, corporate ethics, corporate social
responsibility and the learning organization. Barry Whittingham illustrates with international case studies
from various industries how and why these defences have failed in the past, and more importantly, how to
strengthen corporate systems to prevent future major accidents.

The case studies include:

The loss of the space shuttle Columbia●

Infant heart surgery at Bristol Royal Infirmary●

The Davis-Besse nuclear power plant incident●

The fire and explosion at the Conoco-Phillips Humber oil refinery●

Herald of Free Enterprise and Southall rail accident manslaughter prosecutions●

This book is essential reading for all those with a professional interest in health and safety management, the
control of major risk and accident prevention, in particular for directors, senior managers and health & safety
professionals in high-hazard industries and public operations, such as nuclear, chemicals, construction, oil
and gas, energy, manufacturing and transportation.

Barry Whittingham has worked as a senior manager, design engineer and consultant for the chemical,
nuclear, offshore, oil and gas, railway and aviation sectors. He developed a career as a safety consultant
specializing in the human factors aspects of accident causation. Barry is a Fellow of the Safety and
Reliability Society.

 Download Preventing Corporate Accidents ...pdf

 Read Online Preventing Corporate Accidents ...pdf

http://bookengine.site/go/read.php?id=0750680628
http://bookengine.site/go/read.php?id=0750680628
http://bookengine.site/go/read.php?id=0750680628
http://bookengine.site/go/read.php?id=0750680628
http://bookengine.site/go/read.php?id=0750680628
http://bookengine.site/go/read.php?id=0750680628
http://bookengine.site/go/read.php?id=0750680628
http://bookengine.site/go/read.php?id=0750680628


Download and Read Free Online Preventing Corporate Accidents Robert Whittingham

From reader reviews:

Karl Harms:

Book is usually written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can know everything you want by a
book. Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important matter to bring us around the
world. Alongside that you can your reading skill was fluently. A guide Preventing Corporate Accidents will
make you to possibly be smarter. You can feel a lot more confidence if you can know about anything. But
some of you think that will open or reading a new book make you bored. It is not make you fun. Why they
might be thought like that? Have you in search of best book or ideal book with you?

John Warner:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive currently, people
have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice by
simply surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated this for a while is reading.
Yeah, by reading a guide your ability to survive raise then having chance to endure than other is high. To suit
your needs who want to start reading any book, we give you that Preventing Corporate Accidents book as
beginner and daily reading book. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Robert Holt:

This book untitled Preventing Corporate Accidents to be one of several books this best seller in this year, this
is because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily to buy this kind of
book in the book retailer or you can order it through online. The publisher on this book sells the e-book too.
It makes you more readily to read this book, because you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is
no reason to you to past this reserve from your list.

John Gravatt:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our information for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we want. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year had
been exactly added. This guide Preventing Corporate Accidents was filled regarding science. Spend your
time to add your knowledge about your science competence. Some people has diverse feel when they reading
the book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you can sense enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era
like currently, many ways to get book that you just wanted.
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