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From Canton Restaurant to Panda Express takes readers on a compelling journey from the California Gold
Rush to the present, letting readers witness both the profusion of Chinese restaurants across the United States
and the evolution of many distinct American-Chinese iconic dishes from chop suey to General Tso’s
chicken. Along the way, historian Haiming Liu explains how the immigrants adapted their traditional food to
suit local palates, and gives readers a taste of Chinese cuisine embedded in the bittersweet story of Chinese
Americans.
 
Treating food as a social history, Liu explores why Chinese food changed and how it has influenced
American culinary culture, and how Chinese restaurants have become places where shared ethnic identity is
affirmed—not only for Chinese immigrants but also for American Jews. The book also includes a look at
national chains like P. F. Chang’s and a consideration of how Chinese food culture continues to spread
around the globe. 
 
Drawing from hundreds of historical and contemporary newspaper reports, journal articles, and writings on
food in both English and Chinese, From Canton Restaurant to Panda Express represents a groundbreaking
piece of scholarly research. It can be enjoyed equally as a fascinating set of stories about Chinese migration,
cultural negotiation, race and ethnicity, diverse flavored Chinese cuisine and its share in American food
market today.
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From reader reviews:

Jane Riley:

Do you one of people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained inside the straightway, hold on guys
this kind of aren't like that. This From Canton Restaurant to Panda Express: A History of Chinese Food in
the United States (Asian American Studies Today) book is readable simply by you who hate the straight
word style. You will find the details here are arrange for enjoyable examining experience without leaving
even decrease the knowledge that want to supply to you. The writer associated with From Canton Restaurant
to Panda Express: A History of Chinese Food in the United States (Asian American Studies Today) content
conveys the thought easily to understand by a lot of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the
articles but it just different as it. So , do you even now thinking From Canton Restaurant to Panda Express: A
History of Chinese Food in the United States (Asian American Studies Today) is not loveable to be your top
listing reading book?

Ernest Villa:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with close friends is thing
that usually you might have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try thing that really
opposite from that. A single activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you have been ride on and with addition details. Even you love From Canton Restaurant to Panda
Express: A History of Chinese Food in the United States (Asian American Studies Today), you may enjoy
both. It is very good combination right, you still would like to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh
occur its mind hangout men. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its named reading friends.

Rickie Miller:

A lot of publication has printed but it differs. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the top
book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is named of book From Canton
Restaurant to Panda Express: A History of Chinese Food in the United States (Asian American Studies
Today). You can include your knowledge by it. Without departing the printed book, it might add your
knowledge and make an individual happier to read. It is most significant that, you must aware about reserve.
It can bring you from one location to other place.

Andrew Murphy:

Some individuals said that they feel uninterested when they reading a book. They are directly felt this when
they get a half parts of the book. You can choose the particular book From Canton Restaurant to Panda
Express: A History of Chinese Food in the United States (Asian American Studies Today) to make your
personal reading is interesting. Your own personal skill of reading talent is developing when you like
reading. Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy you just read it and mingle the feeling about book and
looking at especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to wide open a book and study it. Beside that the



reserve From Canton Restaurant to Panda Express: A History of Chinese Food in the United States (Asian
American Studies Today) can to be your brand new friend when you're experience alone and confuse in
doing what must you're doing of the time.
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