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This electronic book on CD-ROM provides a unique and comprehensive collection of American government
documents on the Abrams Battle Tank, used by the U.S. Army since 1980. The disc also includes coverage
of the Stryker combat vehicle and the Stryker Brigade Combat Team (SBCT) infantry battalion. There are 7
video clips, along with 59 high-resolution image files in JPG format. The Abrams tank closes with and
destroys enemy forces on the integrated battlefield using mobility, firepower, and shock effect. There are
three variants in service: M1, M1A1 and M1A2. The 120mm main gun on the M1A1 and M1A2, combined
with the powerful 1,500 hp turbine engine and special armor, make the Abrams tank particularly suitable for
attacking or defending against large concentrations of heavy armor forces on a highly lethal battlefield.
Features of the M1A1 modernization program include increased armor protection; suspension improvements;
and a nuclear, biological and chemical (NBC) protection system that increases survivability in a
contaminated environment. The M1A1D modification consists of an M1A1 with integrated computer and a
far-target-designation capability. The M1A2 modernization program includes a commander's independent
thermal viewer, an improved commander's weapon station, position navigation equipment, a distributed data
and power architecture, an embedded diagnostic system and improved fire control systems. The M1A2
System Enhancement Program (SEP) adds second-generation thermal sensors and a thermal management
system. The SEP includes upgrades to processors/memory that enable the M1A2 to use The Army's common
command and control software, enabling the rapid transfer of digital situational data and overlays. The CD-
ROM disc has over 5,000 pages reproduced using Adobe Acrobat PDF software - allowing direct viewing on
Windows and Macintosh systems. Advanced search and indexing features are built into our reproduction,
providing a complete full-text index. This enables the user to search all the files on the disk at one time for
words or phrases using just one search command! The Acrobat cataloging technology adds enormous value
and uncommon functionality to this impressive collection. Our news and educational discs are privately
compiled collections of official public domain U.S. government files and documents - they are not produced
by the federal government. They are designed to provide a convenient user-friendly reference work, utilizing
the benefits of the Adobe Acrobat format to uniformly present thousands of pages that can be rapidly
reviewed, searched by finding specific words, or printed without untold hours of tedious research and
downloading. Vast archives of important public domain government information that might otherwise
remain inaccessible are available for instant review no matter where you are. This book-on-a-disc format
makes a great reference work and educational tool. There is no other reference that is as fast, convenient,
comprehensive, thoroughly researched, and portable - everything you need to know, from the federal sources
you trust.
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From reader reviews:

Malcolm Khan:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new
facts. When you read a e-book you will get new information since book is one of several ways to share the
information or even their idea. Second, reading through a book will make a person more imaginative. When
you reading through a book especially fictional works book the author will bring that you imagine the story
how the personas do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to other folks. When you read this
2010 Essential Guide to the Abrams Tank - M1, M1A1, M1A2, America's Main Battle Tank (CD-ROM),
you may tells your family, friends and also soon about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire the
mediocre, make them reading a book.

Donald Jefferies:

Reading can called imagination hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book particularly book
entitled 2010 Essential Guide to the Abrams Tank - M1, M1A1, M1A2, America's Main Battle Tank (CD-
ROM) your thoughts will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in most aspect that maybe
unfamiliar for but surely can become your mind friends. Imaging each and every word written in a
publication then become one form conclusion and explanation that maybe you never get previous to. The
2010 Essential Guide to the Abrams Tank - M1, M1A1, M1A2, America's Main Battle Tank (CD-ROM)
giving you a different experience more than blown away your thoughts but also giving you useful facts for
your better life in this particular era. So now let us present to you the relaxing pattern is your body and mind
are going to be pleased when you are finished studying it, like winning a sport. Do you want to try this
extraordinary wasting spare time activity?

Charles Wright:

2010 Essential Guide to the Abrams Tank - M1, M1A1, M1A2, America's Main Battle Tank (CD-ROM) can
be one of your beginning books that are good idea. Most of us recommend that straight away because this
book has good vocabulary which could increase your knowledge in words, easy to understand, bit
entertaining however delivering the information. The author giving his/her effort to place every word into
satisfaction arrangement in writing 2010 Essential Guide to the Abrams Tank - M1, M1A1, M1A2,
America's Main Battle Tank (CD-ROM) however doesn't forget the main level, giving the reader the hottest
as well as based confirm resource data that maybe you can be one of it. This great information could drawn
you into fresh stage of crucial contemplating.

Cassandra Harvey:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library as well as to
make summary for some book, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's heart or real their



leisure activity. They just do what the educator want, like asked to go to the library. They go to presently
there but nothing reading really. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring and can't see
colorful photographs on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we
know that on this period, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, many ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore , this 2010 Essential Guide to the Abrams Tank - M1, M1A1, M1A2, America's
Main Battle Tank (CD-ROM) can make you truly feel more interested to read.
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