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Grounded equally in discussions of theater history, literary genre, and theory, Martin Puchner's Stage Fright:
Modernism, Anti-Theatricality, and Drama explores the conflict between avant-garde theater and
modernism. While the avant-garde celebrated all things theatrical, a dominant strain of modernism tended to
define itself against the theater, valuing lyric poetry and the novel instead. Defenders of the theater dismiss
modernism's aversion to the stage and its mimicking actors as one more form of the old "anti-theatrical"
prejudice. But Puchner shows that modernism's ambivalence about the theater was shared even by
playwrights and directors and thus was a productive force responsible for some of the greatest achievements
in dramatic literature and theater.

A reaction to the aggressive theatricality of Wagner and his followers, the modernist backlash against the
theater led to the peculiar genre of the closet drama?a theatrical piece intended to be read rather than
staged?whose long-overlooked significance Puchner traces from the theatrical texts of Mallarmé and Stein to
the dramatic "Circe" chapter of Joyce's Ulysses. At times, then, the anti-theatrical impulse leads to a
withdrawal from the theater. At other times, however, it returns to the stage, when Yeats blends lyric poetry
with Japanese Nôh dancers, when Brecht controls the stage with novelistic techniques, and when Beckett
buries his actors in barrels and behind obsessive stage directions. The modernist theater thus owes much to
the closet drama whose literary strategies it blends with a new mise en scène. While offering an alternative
history of modernist theater and literature, Puchner also provides a new account of the contradictory forces
within modernism.
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From reader reviews:

James Crow:

What do you think about book? It is just for students because they are still students or the item for all people
in the world, what best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that problem above. Every person has
various personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that
they don't would like do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Stage Fright:
Modernism, Anti-Theatricality, and Drama. All type of book could you see on many solutions. You can look
for the internet options or other social media.

Gerald Chisholm:

What do you about book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material when you need
something to explain what the ones you have problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy
individual? If you don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And
you have spare time? What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. They have to answer
that question since just their can do this. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is
appropriate. Because start from on guardería until university need this specific Stage Fright: Modernism,
Anti-Theatricality, and Drama to read.

Francis Knapp:

Here thing why this specific Stage Fright: Modernism, Anti-Theatricality, and Drama are different and
reliable to be yours. First of all reading through a book is good however it depends in the content from it
which is the content is as delightful as food or not. Stage Fright: Modernism, Anti-Theatricality, and Drama
giving you information deeper since different ways, you can find any reserve out there but there is no reserve
that similar with Stage Fright: Modernism, Anti-Theatricality, and Drama. It gives you thrill reading journey,
its open up your own eyes about the thing that happened in the world which is probably can be happened
around you. You can easily bring everywhere like in area, café, or even in your method home by train. When
you are having difficulties in bringing the published book maybe the form of Stage Fright: Modernism, Anti-
Theatricality, and Drama in e-book can be your substitute.

David Dabbs:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their spare time with their family,
or their own friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, planning to beach, or picnic
from the park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something
different to fill your free time/ holiday? May be reading a book might be option to fill your free time/
holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want to try
look for book, may be the e-book untitled Stage Fright: Modernism, Anti-Theatricality, and Drama can be
fine book to read. May be it could be best activity to you.
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