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An interactive guide to successfully trading in today's markets

Mastering the Art of Equity Trading Through Simulation is a guidebook to interactive computer trading
simulation designed to provide participants with hands-on experience in making tactical decisions and
implementing them in different market environments-from continuous order drive markets to call auction
markets, and from dealer markets to dark liquidity pools.

By showing traders how to operate in these different markets, this reliable resource quickly reveals a good
deal about what trading involves and how market design impacts trading decisions.

Provides a virtual platform that gives users hands-on experience in making tactical trading decisions●

Shows exactly how prices are established in the marketplace●

Teaches how the structure of a marketplace influences participant decisions●

Learning to trade through study is like learning about a roller coaster ride verbally. You may get the idea of
going up and down and around curves, but will lack the actual experience. Mastering the Art of Equity
Trading Through Simulation will get you as close as possible to the markets-without actually going in them-
and prepare you to profit once you're really there.
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From reader reviews:

Kathy Natal:

The book Mastering the Art of Equity Trading Through Simulation, + Web-Based Software: The TraderEx
Course make you feel enjoy for your spare time. You may use to make your capable much more increase.
Book can to be your best friend when you getting anxiety or having big problem using your subject. If you
can make reading a book Mastering the Art of Equity Trading Through Simulation, + Web-Based Software:
The TraderEx Course being your habit, you can get more advantages, like add your personal capable,
increase your knowledge about several or all subjects. It is possible to know everything if you like available
and read a guide Mastering the Art of Equity Trading Through Simulation, + Web-Based Software: The
TraderEx Course. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science guide or encyclopedia or other
individuals. So , how do you think about this guide?

Tonya Deschamps:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book
thus. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new facts.
When you read a publication you will get new information since book is one of various ways to share the
information as well as their idea. Second, looking at a book will make you more imaginative. When you
studying a book especially hype book the author will bring one to imagine the story how the character types
do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other people. When you read this Mastering the Art
of Equity Trading Through Simulation, + Web-Based Software: The TraderEx Course, you are able to tells
your family, friends along with soon about yours reserve. Your knowledge can inspire average, make them
reading a reserve.

Betty Neal:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them
friends and family or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just
watching TV, or perhaps playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity here
is look different you can read some sort of book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book you
read you can spent 24 hours a day to reading a e-book. The book Mastering the Art of Equity Trading
Through Simulation, + Web-Based Software: The TraderEx Course it is quite good to read. There are a lot of
people who recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this book. Should you did not have
enough space bringing this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore quickly to read this book from a
smart phone. The price is not very costly but this book features high quality.

David Thompson:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside together with friends, fun activity together with
family or just watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by reading



through a book. Ugh, think reading a book really can hard because you have to bring the book everywhere?
It alright you can have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like
Mastering the Art of Equity Trading Through Simulation, + Web-Based Software: The TraderEx Course
which is obtaining the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's find.
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